IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Isopropyl Alcohol, 70%,

Isopropyl Alchol, 70%,

ITEM #1 gallon size ITEM #2 16 0z. size ITEM #3 Alcohol Dispenser, push-top
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
MEDCO Supply 136.54 Swan 263123 32.40 Swan 34001M 35.76 Menda 34026M
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid 36.00 PS-115 45.00 PS-3134
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. 93.00 Humco 172-2636 39.60 Humco 172-2628 36.00 Tech-Med 4024
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

BSN-Jobst Coverlet
Adhesive Dressing, 4-Wing,
50/box, 3"x3" or approved

BSN-Jobst Coverlet
Adhesive Dressing, 2"x3"
patches, 50/box or

Nexcare Waterproof
Bandages, Asst, 30/box or

ITEM # 4 sub ITEM #5 approved sub ITEM # 6 approved sub
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
MEDCO Supply 445.44 BSN 22028M 273.12 BSN 22023M No Bid
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical 470.40 BEI-00385 271.20 No Bid
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 591.84 BEIRSDORF 00385 340.80 = BEIRSDORF 00340000 No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. 477.60 BSN 00385 273.12 BSN 00340000 No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Non-Sterile Gauze
Sponges, 3"x3", 12-ply,

Kleenex Facial Tissues, 2-
ply, 36 boxes/cs, 100
tissues/box or acceptable

Dermabond Topical Skin
Adhesive, 12/box or

ITEM #7 200/pkg ITEM #8 alt. ITEM #9 acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT _ MFR&MODEL® |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
MEDCO Supply 5.66 Dukal 267673 46.72 Kleenex 65601 759.14 Dermabond 12346
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical 94.00 PS-3312 39.60 KC-21340 827.90 ETH-DHV12
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 114.00 Select Medical 3312 No Bid 939.02 ETHICON DHV 12
R. Weinstein, Inc. 149.20 AMD-RITMED 155332 No Bid 724.46 ETHICON DHV 12
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Betadine Surgical Scrub, 16
0z w/dispenser & Gallon

Hydrocortisone Cream, 1%,

Bacitracin Ointment, 1 oz.

ITEM #10 size or approved sub ITEM #11 10 gr ITEM #12 tube or acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL# |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Betadine 040508 Fougera 69135
MEDCO Supply 106.20 Betadine 040510 18.60 (1 ounce) 30.36 Fougera 36005M
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PF-6761815117
PSS World Medical 86.40 no bid on gallon size No Bid No Bid
PURDUE FREDERIC
6761815117 PERRIGO]
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 174.38 6761815101 No Bid 30.72 3562030-291336
Fougera 0011-35
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid 21.00 TARO 390013 26.40 (1/2 oz.)|
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Neosporin Ointment or triple
antibiotic, 1 oz. tube or

Zinc Oxide Ointment USP, 1

Hydrogen Peroxide Solution

ITEM #13 acceptable alt. ITEM #14 0z. tube ITEM #15 3%, 16 oz. hottle

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ |MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 86.76 Neosporin 69570 11.52 Fougera 70320 7.08 Swan 34060M
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical 31.80 AMS-00713026831 10.80 AMS-00168006231 8.40 PS-679
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 91.80 PFIZER 23737 15.00 Fougera 06231 10.20 Select Med 117
R. Weinstein, Inc. 35.40 Fougera 390105 18.00 Fougera 172-7437 11.88 Sunmark 172-2966
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Hibiclens
Antiseptic/Antimicrobial Skin

Cleanser, 16 oz w/ pump & Refresh Plus Lubricant Eye Fougera Puralube Tears,
Gallon size & Hibistat Wipes Drops .01 oz, 30/box or 1/2 oz bottle or acceptable
ITEM #16 (50/bx) or approved sub ITEM #17 acceptable alt. ITEM #18 alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ |MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hibiclens 69132
Hibiclens 69134
MEDCO Supply 445.04 Hibiclens 55981 385.92 Refresh 12003 No Bid
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mol-57516
Mol-57591
PSS World Medical 225.90 no bid on wipes No Bid No Bid
Molnlycke 57516
Molnlycke 57591 Amerisource 4684065-
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 607.98 Molnlycke 58717 414.00 566000 No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid 303.84 Allergan 136-4074 135.00 Hi-Tech 112-0559
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Halls Drops, 30/bag,

Cepacol Lozenges, Cherry

Advil, 200 mg. Tablets 50

Menthol, Honey-Lemon or flavor, 648/cs or acceptable pkt/2 tablets per box or
ITEM #19 acceptable alt. ITEM #20 alt. ITEM #21 acceptable alt.

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Halls 44003M Cepacol 44010M

MEDCO Supply 78.72 Halls 44032M 380.00 Original Mint 1,128.96 Advil 68126

Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid 1,080.00 AMS-00573015489]
Amerisource 4404422

R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid 1,459.20 294604

Cadbury 242-3473
R. Weinstein, Inc. 93.60 Cadbury 242-3226 990.00 Combe 184-0263 No Bid

Page 7



IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

ChapsStick Lip Balm, .15 o0z

Blistex Ointment, .21 oz. stick, SPF 30 Ultra or 3 M Save a Tooth MBM
ITEM #22 tube or acceptable alt. ITEM #23 acceptable alt. ITEM #24 #TP3001 or acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
MEDCO Supply 97.80 Blistex 34046M 995.00 Chapstick 34067M 67.14 = Save a Tooth 47013M
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. 118.50 Blistex 114-3213 945.00 Schering 216-6045 No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Sun Glare Black, 75 oz stick

Vaseline 100% Pure, 3.75

Purell Instant Hand
Sanitizer, .5 0z bottle & 8 0z

ITEM #25 or acceptable alt. ITEM #26 0z jar or acceptable alt. ITEM #27 pump or acceptable alt.

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL# |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Purell 27006
MEDCO Supply 53.16 Cramer 17440 22.20 Vaseline 36054M 158.04 Purell 54046 M|
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid No Bid No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid 23.40 Vi-Jon Inc. 198-2966 No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Nivea Moisturizing Cream, 2

Lubriderm Lotion 16 oz Multistix 10 SG 100/bottle o] 0z tube, 24 tubes/cs or
ITEM #28 pump size or acceptable alt. ITEM #29 acceptable alt. ITEM #30 acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODELZ |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
MEDCO Supply 196.08 Lubriderm 37006M 31.80 Diascreen 87051 75.12 Nivea 94141
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid 46.00 AME-2161 79.20 AMS-07214040776
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid 60.75 Bayer 2161 No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. 200.64 J&J 168-3515 39.95 Arkram D11000 70.32 Beiersdorf 124-4920
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Skin-Lube 5 Ib jar or

Sport Shield Anti-Abrasion
Sport 1.5 oz roll-on or

Conforming Stretch Gauze
Bandages Sterile, 3"x4.1 yd.

ITEM #31 acceptable alt. ITEM #32 acceptable alt. ITEM #33 12 rls/bag

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 135.68 Cramer 59160 98.76 Sport Shield 559472 21.90 Dukal 010703
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid 29.70 PS-016
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid 35.70 Select Med 018
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Breathe Right Nasal Strips
Small/Med & Large or

Tuf-Skin, aerosol spray 4
0z. can, 12 canslcs or

Tuf-Skin, aerosol spray 10
oz. can, 12 cans/cs or

ITEM #34 acceptable alt. ITEM #35 acceptable alt. ITEM #36 acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL# |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Breath Right 260186,
No bid on Sm/Med
MEDCO Supply 639.36 Clear Strips 89.52 Cramer 12370C 247.68 Cramer 12390C
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid 149.90 CRM-204027 449.55 CRM-204033
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid 187.30 Cramer 204027 567.00 Cramer 204033
GSK 141-4739
R. Weinstein, Inc. 725.40 GSK 218-6641 No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Pre-Taping Underwrap J & J
#5185, 2.75" x 30 yd. 48

J & J ZONAS Athletic Tape
Speed Pack #5190, 1.5" x
15 yds porous, 32 ris/cs or

J & J Coach Athletic Tape
Speed Pack #5188 1.5" x 15
yd. porous, 32 rls/cs or
approved sub. (Delivery

ITEM #37 rs/cs, or approved sub ITEM #38 approved sub ITEM #39 stipulations)

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 1,580.40 Cramer 92200 4,402.00 J&J) 32042M 7,654.00 J&J 32044M
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical 1,971.00 JJC-005185 6,250.00 JJC-5190 11,090.00 JJC-005188
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 2,700.00 J&J 5185 7,000.00 J&J 5190 11,560.00 J&J 005188
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

M Tape. Black, 1.5" x 12.5
yds, 32 rls/cs or acceptable

J & J Elastikon Elastic Tape
#5174 tinted 5 yd stretched,
2" width, 6 rls/bx, 12 bxs/cs

J & J Elastikon Elastic Tape
#5175 tinted 5 yd stretched,
3" width, 4 rls/bx, 12 bxs/cs

ITEM #40 alt. ITEM #41 or approved sub ITEM #42 or approved sub

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 3,066.60 Mueller 84942 1,844.76 J&J 84420C 5,571.36 J&J 84440C
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical No Bid 2,062.20 JJC-005174 6,186.60 JJC-005175
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid 2,830.80 J&J 005174 8,492.40 J&J 005175
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Sherwood Ultra-Light
#330031 or coNco Pro's
Choice #64730000, 3"x7.5
yds. 16 rls/cs or approved

Sherwood Ultra-Light
#330023 or coNco Pro's
Choice #64720000, 2'x7.5
yds. 24 rls/cs or approved

Sherwood Ultra-Light
#330015 or coNco Pro's
Choice #64710000, 1.5"x7.5
yds, 32 rls/cs or approved

ITEM #43 sub (Delivery stipulations) ITEM #44 sub (Delivery stipulations) ITEM #45 sub
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR&MODEL# |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
MEDCO Supply 12,000.00 Conco 94733 8,000.00 Conco 94722 2,000.00 Conco 94711
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical 13,950.00 COC-64730000, 9,300.00 COC-64720000 2,325.00 COC-6471000
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LL{ 16,770.00 Hartmann 6473000 11,180.00 Hartmann 6472000 2,795.00 Hartmann 647100
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

J&J ZONAS Athletic Tape,
1"x10 yds. 12 rls/bx, 12

J&J ZONAS Athletic Tape,
.5"x10 yds. 24 rls/bx, 12

J&J Waterproof Tape 1"
width, 12 rls/bx & 2" width 6

ITEM #46 bxs/cs or approved sub ITEM #47 bxs/cs or approved sub ITEM #48 ris/box or acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kendall 559483
MEDCO Supply 220.80 J&J 85420C 220.80 J&J 85400C 810.72 Kendall 559484
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
JJC-005132
PSS World Medical 239.90 JJC-005104 239.90 JJC-005103 802.80 JJC-005134
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 319.80 J&J 005104 319.80 J&J 005103 No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Omnifix Latex Free Non-
Woven Retention Tape,
2"x10 yd/bx & 4" x 10 yd/bx

Kinesio Tape in various

Powerflex, 3"x6 yd., Black

ITEM #49 or approved sub. ITEM #50 colors or approved sub. ITEM #51 or approved sub
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
266956, 266195,
266196, 266197,
Hartmann 36211 266194, No bid on
MEDCO Supply 394.68 Hartmann 36411 1,348.68 Beige-3"x5.5yds 2,046.00 Powerflex 37906
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
COC-36210000
PSS World Medical 438.60 COC-364000 No Bid No Bid
Hartmann 36210000
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 8,052.00 | Hartmann 36410000 No Bid No Bid
36210000
R. Weinstein, Inc. 487.70 36410000 No Bid No Bid
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University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,

Mueller M-Wrap, 2.75"x30

Cramer Tape Remover, Pint
size, 12/case, or acceptable

Pro Wrist Support, #710-1

ITEM #52 yd., Green or acceptable alt. ITEM #53 alt. ITEM #54 or approved sub.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
Don Joy
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid 414.00 11-0386-x-06060
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
IMEDCO Supply 316.08 Cramer 21467 303.00 Cramer 86120C No Bid
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid 412.20 No Bid
Pro Orthopedic
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid 135.60 Pro 710
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433

To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

AirCast Air Stirrup Leg
Brace, Standard, 10.5" long,

Encore Personal Arm Sling
mesh knit w/adjustable
hook, loop closure strap and
thumb loop, Medium, or

Tennis Elbow Support, 1/8"
neoprene, Universal size,

ITEM #55 Right, Left or acceptable alt. ITEM #56 acceptable alt. ITEM #57 Black
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODELZ |
Procare ProCare 79-82543,
DJO-02AR 79-84255 (12 pk) 79-82545, 79-82547,
DJO, LLC 248.40 DJO-02AL 105.93 79-84257 (12 pk) 89.28 79-82548, 79-82549]
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
15030
MEDCO Supply 399.84 15040 No Bid 70.08 McDavid 37310}
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid 107.16 Cerflex 88-3021
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid No Bid 44.28 DJ Ortho 79-81031
DJ ORTHO 03AR
R. Weinstein, Inc. 630.00 DJ ORTHO 03AL No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Airsport Ankle Brace
Various Sizes or acceptable

Pro #110-A Open Knee
Sleeve 1/8" neoprene
rubber, Black, Various sizes

Signature Soft Thumbster
Orthopedic Outfitters #73-5000,

ITEM #58 alt. ITEM #59 or approved sub. ITEM #60 Universal size or approved sub,
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DonlJoy
11-0358-1-06000,
11-0358-2-06000,
11-0358-3-06000,
02MSR, 02MMR, 11-0358-4-06000,
02MLR, 02MSL, 11-0358-5-06000,
DJO, LLC 643.50 02MML, 02MLL 1,890.00 11-0358-6-06000, No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
15103,15104, 15105, 55550, 55552, 55553,
MEDCO Supply 1,060.80 15100, 15101, 15102 1,616.58 55554, 55555, 55556 No Bid
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid 196.80
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
DJO 02MSR, 02MMR,
02MLR, 02MSL, PRO Orthopedic Pro
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 1,335.00 02MML, 02MLL 1,505.70 110A No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,

University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

PRO #500 Thigh Support
1/8" neoprene rubber, Black

PRO #400 Elbow Sleeve 1/8"
neoprene rubber, Black, Various Various sizes, or approved
ITEM #61 sizes or approved sub. ITEM #62 sub. ITEM #63 Nose Guard
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ |MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
Donloy]
11-0001-1-06000, DonlJoy
11-0001-2-06000, 11-0011-2-06000,
11-0001-3-06000, 11-0011-3-06000,
11-0001-4-06000, 11-0011-4-06000,
11-0001-5-06000, 11-0011-5-06000,
DJO, LLC 346.50 11-0001-6-06000 1,152.00 11-0011-6-06000 No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
37180, 37182,
37183,37184, 37185, 89430, 89432, 89433,
MEDCO Supply 384.30 No bid on XX-Large 1,143.36 89434, 89435 45.34 Athletic 47060
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro Orthopedic Pro Orthopedic
400 XS, 400 SML, 500 SML, 500 MED,
400 MED, 400 LG, 500 LG, 500 XL,
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 373.80 400 XL, 400 XXL 1,090.00 500 XXL No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,

Stax Finger Splint Kit or

PRO #280 Double Pull
Lumbar Support, Various

ASO w/ "H" Logo, Black,

ITEM #64 acceptable alt. ITEM #65 sizes or approved sub. ITEM #66 Various Sizes.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ |MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ |MFR & MODEL #
02TSL Ift / 02TSR rt,
DonlJoy| 02TML Ift / 02TMR rt,
11-0466-1, 11-0466-2, O2TLL Ift / O2TLR rt,
79-72250 11-0466-3, 11-0466-4, no bid on x-small and
DJO, LLC 99.36 79-72260 1,207.50 11-0466-5, 11-0466-6 2,583.60 x-large
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
558502, 558503,
60200, 60202, 60203, 558504, 558505,
MEDCO Supply 67.52 Stax 39500 1,225.44 | 60204, 60205, 60206 4,297.80 558506, (No Logo)
Medical Specialties
163031, 163032,
163034, 163035,
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. 179.70 844.56 163036, 163037 3,580.20
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro Orthopedic
280 XS, 280 SML,
HARTMANN-CONCO 280 MED, 280 LG,
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 192.00 69990000 1,103.08 280 XL, 280 XXL No Bid
CONCO
R. Weinstein, Inc. 175.60 69990000 No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Aluminum Crutches Quick

Spenco Polysorb Cross

DonJoy High Tide Walker
#11-0179 & #11-0178 Cast

adjustable w/accessories, Trainer Insoles, Various Immobilizer, Various sizes,
ITEM #67 Tall adult 5'10"-6'6". ITEM #68 sizes, or acceptable alt. ITEM #69 or acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ |MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ |MFR & MODEL #
11-0179-2-06136,
11-0179-4-06136,
11-0178-2-06136,
11-0178-3-06136,
DJO, LLC 431.28 79-91337 No Bid 469.50 11-0178-4-06136
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
55100902, 55100903, 900132, 900134,
55100904, 55100905, 900135, 900136,
MEDCO Supply 151.92 Graham 33240 1,007.64 55100906 667.38 900137
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
38-034-02, 38-034-03,
38-034-04, 38-034-05,
PSS World Medical 202.20 PS-4570 1,036.80 38-034-06 No Bid
Spenco 38-034-02,
Spenco 38-034-03,
Spenco 38-034-04,
Spenco 38-034-05,
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC 234.00 | Medline MDSV 80534 1,074.60 Spenco 38-034-06 No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. 299.40 INVACARE 8115-T] No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Comprem LF Tubular Compression
Bandage, Size E, Size F, or

IOGEL, 12/bx, Small,
Medium, Large, or

ITEM #70 acceptable alt. ITEM #71 Digit Covers, One size fits all. ITEM #72 acceptable alt.

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 803.04 30042M, 30043 M 202.80 Cramer 27982 2,352.06 ' 55001, 55002, 55003
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid

R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

CONCO 83050000
R. Weinstein, Inc. 814.80 CONCO 83060000 No Bid No Bid

Page 24




IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

AlumiFoam Finger Splints,
3/4"x18" & 1"x18", or

Theraputty Resistive Hand
Exercise Material 2 oz. size
Coral/Med, Blue/Heavy, or

Aquaplast-T Splinting
Material 1/8"x18"x24",
White, Solid or acceptable

ITEM #73 acceptable alt. ITEM #74 acceptable alt. ITEM #75 alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sammons 5072,
MEDCO Supply 26.50 65502, 65503 31.44 Sammons 5073 36.48 80361
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
DJO-79-72165
PSS World Medical 20.00 DJO-79-72167 No Bid No Bid
Chattanooga
10-0902
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid 76.80 10-0903 175.80 Rolyan A9627 2C2
CONCO 6234
R. Weinstein, Inc. 31.90 CONCO 62100000 No Bid No Bid
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University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,

Chattanooga Hydrocollator
HotPacs, Standard size,

Chattanooga Hydrocollator
ColPacs, Standard size,

Patellar Stabilizing Knee

ITEM #76 10"x12": or approved sub. ITEM #77 11"x14": or approved sub. ITEM #78 Brace, Various sizes.

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL# |

11-0554-2-06000,

11-0554-3-06000,

11-0554-4-06000,

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid 976.50 11-0554-6-06000,
Medic Distributors, Inc. 184.08 219.96 No Bid

Mueller|

231300, 231301,

MEDCO Supply 68.64 48820 113.64 29751 823.20 231302, 23134

88-5103, 88-5104,

Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid 1049.58 88-5105, 88-5097
PSS World Medical 138.60 CHT-1006 165.60 CHT-1500 No Bid

Pro Orthopedic

180 Dr. M SML,

180 Dr. M MED,

180 Dr. M LG,

R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLA 126.00 Chattanooga 1006 142.80 Chattanooga 1500 1,197.00 180 Dr. M XXL|
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Mueller Jumpers Knee
Strap, Universal size,
Green, Black, or acceptable

Insect Sting Kill Swabs or
Medicaine Swabs, 0.6 ml.
swab 10/bx or acceptable

Round Style Sling

ITEM #79 alt. ITEM #80 alt. ITEM #81 Psychrometer.

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 282.24 99924, 99920 31.80 Medicane 68450 87.94 General 87925
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid

R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Flex-All 454 Analgesic Balm
Extra Strength 4 oz. bottle &
Gallon size, or acceptable

BioFreeze 3 oz. roll-on &
Gallon size, or acceptable

Band-Adi Blister Block
1.75"x2-5/8", 4/pk, or

ITEM #82 alt. ITEM #83 alt. ITEM #84 approved sub.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR&MODEL# |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
13160
MEDCO Supply 538.08 36072M 580.96 29206, 29207 No Bid
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PHI-BUSAR03-144|
PSS World Medical No Bid 615.00 PHI-BUSAPGA-004 No Bid
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid 593.00 No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Finger Nail Clippers, 2.5"

Spenco 2nd skin dressing
Non-sterile, 1" squares, 3"

Lister Bandage Scissors,
7.5" stainless steel or

ITEM #85 long stainless steel. ITEM #86 circles or approved sub. ITEM #87 acceptable alt.

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 6.84  Professional 48134M 877.08 35650, 35690 18.60 Professional 75200
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

SPM-10-637

PSS World Medical 11.40 PS-4585 822.60 SPM-10-603 114.00 PS-06381
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Orig Clauss Super Pro
Scissors, Pro 11 or

Dura Stick Il Electrodes,
2"x2" square, 4/pk or

Cramer Flexi-Wrap w/o
handle, 6"x650', 6 rls/cs, or

ITEM #88 acceptable alt. ITEM #89 acceptable alt. ITEM #90 acceptable alt.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR&MODEL#Z |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid 1,064.00 No Bid
MEDCO Supply 297.48 Pro 11 263021 571.20 72003 988.80 17704
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid 721.60 Chattanooga 42041 No Bid
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

MDI CPR Microkey PRO
packaged w/disposable
nitrile glove, Black,Blue,

ThermaCare Heat Wraps,
Neck, Arm, Small Back,
Large Back, or acceptable

Amerisport Hawkeye

Platinum Hip Pack, Black or

ITEM #91 Green or acceptable alt. ITEM #92 alt. ITEM #93 approved sub.
[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL# |
DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
34562
12591M (Pro) 34560
51072M (Plus) No bid on small back
MEDCO Supply 83.40 51073M (Plus) 335.52 patches 127.86 41694
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid No Bid
R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid No Bid No Bid
WYETH 244-8868,
WYETH 244-8611,
R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid 641.28 WYETH 244-8678 No Bid
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IFB No. 09-0433 To Furnish and Deliver Athletic Training Supplies for the Athletic Training Room,
University of Hawaii at Manoa, Honolulu, Hawaii
Bids Opened: June 18, 2009, 2:30 p.m.

Professional Dual-Head Universal Precautions Kit,
ITEM #94 Training Stethoscope. ITEM #95 Hard case.

[BIDDER AMOUNT __ MFR & MODEL # AMOUNT __ [MFR & MODEL #

DJO, LLC No Bid No Bid

Medic Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid

MEDCO Supply 27.78 Professional 81090 203.28 Safetec 19151M
Orthopedic Outfitters Inc. No Bid No Bid

PSS World Medical No Bid No Bid

R&M Reyes Enterprise, LLG No Bid No Bid

R. Weinstein, Inc. No Bid No Bid
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